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NOVA INVOICE
810 King Street, Suite 424

Alexandria, VA 22314

www.irynova.org

BHLTO Boamiurl SO L T S L

WA Cealitoin of Crime Victim Advocates
Attn: Cody Benson

805 t1th Avenue, SE

STE 1562

Olympia, WA 28501

P.ONG. DATE INVOICE #
82812017 4277
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT
ng{;z{a?fas for NOVA Viclim Assistance Acadamy [NVAAY 75 registrations @ 30,0600.00
3400/each

Profeszional Development | Unme Vichim Advocates and Managars

Total $30,000.00
PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.
Piease reference invoice number on check.
TEYamg wireet, bate 408 Alpaacdeia VA JI11E wweaorynovanrg  offce TULEII ADVA B8ET fae 20T 13955







NOVA INVOICE
510 King Street, Suite 424

Alexandria, VA 22314

www.trynova.org

BILL TC eyt s

WA Coalitoin of Crime Victim Advocalses
Attn: Cody Benson

605 11th Avenue, SE

STE 102

Oiympia, WA 88501

PO ND DATE NVOICE &
62812017 4278
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Registrations for Webinars through the National Advocacy Leadership Center
Professional Development for Crime Vichm Advocates and Managars
NALC Webinars: 384 80 rrunute traming sessions @ $100/kach 358.400.00
Total $36,400.00

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.
Please reference invoice number on check.
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Fraser, Bettx (ATG)
“l_

From: Fraser, Betty (ATG)

Sent: Thursday, August 3, 2017 2:02 PM

To: cody@wcceva.org

Cc Nevares, Melanie (ATG)} (MelanieN@ATG.WA.GOV)

Subject: RE: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advoc:tes

I will process these voices but | can only reimburse $50,136.24, which is what is left in the appropriztion. The
Coalition will have to make up the difference.

Thanks!
Betty

From: Fraser, Betty (ATG)
Sent: Thursday, August 3, 2017 7:17 AM
" To: 'Cody Benson' <cody@wecva.org>
Subject: RE: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates

| just need proof of your payment to NOVA since | am reimbursing the Coalition for these invoices.
Thanks so much!

Betty Fraser, Senior Accounting Supervisor

Financial Services Division
Attorney General’s Office of Washington State
Phone: (360} 753-2553

BettyF@atg.wa.gov

From: Cody Benson [mailto:cody@wccva.org]

Sent: Wednesday, August 2, 2017 6:05 PM

To: Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@ATG.WA.GOV>

Cc: Nevares, Melanie (ATG) <MelanieN@ATG. WA.GOV:>

Subject: Re: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates

That is correct. If we can submit it with the June invoice, that would be great, but if it is too late, please let
me know.

Thanks again!
Cody

On Wed, Aug 2, 2017 at 9:53 AM, Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@atg.wa.gov> wrote:

Is this for one fiscal year? {7/1/2016-6/30/2017)? Yes or No

Thanks!

Betty






From: Cody Benson [maiito:cody@wccva.org]

Sent: Wednesday, August 2, 2017 8:46 AM

To: Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@ATG.WA.GOV>

Cc: Nevares, Melanie (ATG) <MelanieN@ATG. WA.GOV>

Subject: Re: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates

No problem! I apologize I am not more help. I asked NOVA if they could provide more detail on the
invoices. Please see attached. I hope that helps. Again, the "registrations" are the number of seats billed
during the previous grant year for online training access. The charges are for access to 364, 90 minute,
training sessions at $100 each and 75 online sessions for the virtual Victim Assistance Academy at $400
each, which is the program the SHARP advocates use. I am currently out of the office, but if you need
additional information, I should be able to reach the Executive Director at NOVA and ask for assistance.

Thank you!

Cody

On Wed, Aug 2, 2017 at 7:25 AM, Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF(@atg.wa.gov> wrote:

Oh OK, then can we get a timeline and specifics for the current invoice. We are running out of time to put
anything in the prior year. Did the Coalition pay NOVA?

Thank you!

Betty

From: cody [mailto:cody@wceva.org)
Sent: Wednesday, August 2, 2017 3:03 AM

To: Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@ATG.WA.GOV>
Cc: Nevares, Melanie (ATG) <MelanieN@ATG.WA.GOV>
Subject: RE: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates

WCCVA was previously billed for NOVA's Annual Crime Victim Assistance Training, which includes
membership. It is a yearly in person training that is required for WCCVA staff/ board members. The
current invoices from NOVA are for something different. The current invoices are for interactive online
trainings for crime victim advocates through NOVA's National Advocacy Leadership Training Center.
These trainings are designed for community (CVSC Programs) and system based programs ( Victim
Witness Programs). They are the only advocate training programs recognized by the National Department






of Defence for the certificatio.  the SHARP (Sexual Harassment/ As: Prevention) advocates who
work with victims on the military installations.

I hope that helps to clarify. If you think of anything else, I will be available, so please just let me know.

From: "Fraser, Betty (ATG)" <BettvyF@ATG.WA.GOV>

Date: 8/2/17 12:07 AM (GMT=+01:00)

To: Cody Benson <cody@wccva.org>

Cec: "Nevares, Melanie (ATG)" <MelanieN@ATG.WA.GOV>

Subject: RE: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates

Last year we paid $515 for NOVA membership. Was that membership for one year? We were assJuming so when
we reimbursed the Coalition.

Thanks!

Betty

From: Cody Benson [mailto:cody@wccva.org)

Sent: Tuesday, August 1, 2017 2:54 PM

To: Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@ATG.WA.GOV>

Cc: Nevares, Melanie [ATG) <MelanieN@ATG.WA.GOV>

Subject: Re: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates

Yes, that is correct. Both charges from NOV A are processed for the prior grant year, However, the
trainings we were charged for are available anytime the advocates choose to access them. There are no
restrictions placed on access to the webinars or the academies. They can be accessed anytime during any
grant year. We do not have any limitations on accessing online trainings, but it sounds like maybe we are

-






supposed to in order to meet t.  rant requirements. That is where the 1sion comes from on my end.
If NOVA allows us to register for trainings, access trainings, pay for them, in one grant yeur, but we can
still access them the following grant year, are we allowed to do that? Or, do we have to start all over again
each grant year with a new bill and only allow access during that specific grant year?

On Tue, Aug 1, 2017 at 1:27 PM, Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@atg. wa.gov> wrote:

Your funding is on a fiscal year proviso so our reimbursement to you should be yearly for training and training
access (7/1/2016 — 6/30/2017). Please put the year in which the professional training and training access is for
and then we can process payment in the year the training is included. So the attached invoice was process for
payment by the coalition for $36,400.00 during last year fiscal year 2017 (7/1/2016-6/30/2017)?

Is that what you are submitting to us for reimbursement?

l just don't want any audit findings for you all and us.

Thanks!

Betty Fraser, Senior Accounting Supervisor

Financial Services Division
Attorney General's Office of Washington State

Phone: {360) 753-2553

BettyF@atg. wa.gov

From: Cody Benson [mailto:cody@wccva.org)
Sent: Tuesday, August 1, 2017 12:31 PM

To: Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@ATG.WA.GOV>
Cc: Nevares, Melanie (ATG) <MelanieN@ATG.WA.GOV>
Subject: Re: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates

Thank you, Betty!






Just for clarification, do you . we would need a yearly date listed . € invoices for webinars and
trainings? Or a yearly date that indicates advocates are allowed to access the webinars for one year only?
We have always made webinars available for whenever advocates choose to use them, so we will need to
make a lot of changes on our end in order to make this happen, so I want to make sure I ain understanding
correctly.

Also, I know that you are busy, but can you please look at the attached invoices? I wrote the year on them
and am wondering if you can please let me know if this is what would be needed and if we would have to
then get billed again for the current grant year, then again for the following grant vear, etc. You
mentioned a yearly invoice and not carrying trainings over from one year to the next, so it sounds like
that we would need to be billed each year for our seats/acess to the available webinars. Can you please
let me know if that is correct? I want to get a good handle on this before I bring it up to our Board of
Directors.

Thank you!

Cody

On Tue, Aug 1, 2017 at 10:02 AM, Fraser, Betty (ATG) <Bettyl'(@atg. wa.gov> wrote:

. Having yearly dates and specifics is what the auditor would require for any payment that is reimburse to the
- coalition. Thank you for understanding regarding the details.

o Betty Fraser, Senior Accounting Supervisor

Financial Services Division

L . Attorney General's Office of Washington State

Phone: (360} 753-2553

BettyF@atg. wa.gov

From: Cody Benson [mailto:cody@wccva.org)

Sent: Tuesday, August 1, 2017 9:33 AM

To: Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@ATG.WA.GOV>

Subject: Re: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates







* Hi Betty!

. T apologize for the confusion. I think the problem 1 am running into is that the two invoices submitted by
NOVA are essentially the same as those that were submitted by the National Crime Victim Law Institute
. and approved. The difference being that the NOVA trainings are accessed online. The Victim Assistance
- Academies and webinars that have been invoiced are accessed through a virtual academy held in an
interactive online classroom and advocates can participate when they choose (last grant period, current
grant period, or future grant period). It is training that advocates, particularly those in rural and
underserved areas, can use when they are able to do so. We simply have a certain number of "seats"

¥ - available in the virtual online classroom and once they are all used up, then they are gone, but there is no
- date limitation on use. Just like the webinars the WCCVA conducts on its own. We have them online

- and available for advocates for any grant year. Advocates just log on and participate whe 1ever they are
in need of the training,

2 5: The trainings are not a membership, which is why I asked NOVA to provide an actual invoice that better
- reflected the expenditure. I am wondering if a solution might be to pay the invoice for the use of the

~ online trainings, but ask NOVA if they are willing to restrict the dates of use for the online trainings to
only one grant year, as opposed to allowing unlimited access? Otherwise, it sounds like we would not
be able to bill this to the current grant year either, as it would still allow the advocates to access the

. webinars, etc even once the grant year ends. Asking NOVA to restrict online program access seems

somewhat would not be in line with typical online learning, but if that is the case, we will just have to

1 figure it out with them. Please just let me know if that would help in regard to invoicing.

' Thank you again for your patience. I apologize for not having a better understanding of the process as it
pertains to these types of invoicing situations.

© Warmest regards,

- Cody

On Jul 31, 2017, at 11:46 PM, Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@ATG.WA.GOV> wrote:







The training will have e for current year because training is for ‘ntyear. Forthe
membership we need to have dates and how many memberships because we can only do one
year in advance (prepay}. Please provide this detail or we cannot process payment.

Thanks!

Betty

From: Cody Benson [mailto:cody@wccva.org]

Sent: Friday, July 28, 2017 4:11 PM

To: Fraser, Betty (ATG) <BettyF@ATG.WA.GOV>

Subject: Fwd: NOVA invoice for trainings for Washington State Victim Advocates

Betty,

I asked the National Organization for Victim Assistance for an actual invoice that reflects
expenditures made in the previous grant year.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

I hope you have a restful weekend. Thank you again for all of your help.

Warm regards,

Cody

Cody L. Benson
Executive Director






' Washington Coalition of Crit  victim Advocates
. (360) 456-3858 - Office

Cody L. Benson

Executive Director

Washington Coalition of Crime Victim Advocates
(360) 456-3858 - Office

Cody L. Benson

Executive Director

Washington Coalition of Crime Victim Advocates
(360} 456-3858 - Office

Cody L. Benson
Executive Director

Washington Coalition of Crime Victim Advocates
(360) 456-3858 - Office












