From: Sullivan, Stephanie (SAQ)

To: Villarreal, Beau (SAQ)

Subject: FW: Questions

Date: Thursday, February 13, 2025 10:30:57 AM
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Please add this to our workpapers.

From: Sullivan, Stephanie (SAQ)

Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2025 9:33 AM

To: Rachel Christen-Patrick <rchristenpatrick@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: Questions

Hi Rachel,
Thank you for providing the comp information you had. We plan to include and update this
information in our work.

Regarding the dollar per hour part, we did follow back up with the County and it does appear to be
something the system adjusted.

At this time we don’t have any further questions, but appreciate your help with answering our
questions.

Thank you,

Stephanie Sullivan

Special Investigations Program Manager, Office of the Washington State Auditor
(360) 688-0858 | www.sao.wa.gov

From: Rachel Christen-Patrick <rchristenpatrick@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 11, 2025 7:18 PM

To: Sullivan, Stephanie (SAO) <sullivans@sao.wa.gov>

Subject: Re: Questions

External Email

Sorry | neglected to say | worked the 1st of March per my calendar.
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From: Rachel Christen-Patrick <rchristenpatrick@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 11, 2025 5:55:37 PM

To: Sullivan, Stephanie (SAO) <sullivans@sao.wa.gov>

Subject: Questions

So here are the pictures of how my comp was captured. As you can see in March for 3/2-3/3 |
used 20 hours and in February | used 10 hours in 2/28. When | left the county, | still had over

200 hours of comp time.

Did you figure out the dollar per hours that seemed odd? Hopefully you could see it on the
report from payroll.

Please let me know if you have any additional questions. Thank you
Rachel
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